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1. Mobilization/Demobilization/Site Clean-up TOTAL 98,100.00 20,000.00 NO BID
UNIT
2 ea. PRICE 2,100.00 4,000.00
2. Bail Well or Airlift TOTAL 4,200.00 8,000.00 NO BID
UNIT
20 hrs. PRICE 750.00 1,735.00
3. Roto-Scrubbing entire Well TOTAL 15,000.00 34,700.00 NO BID
UNIT
6 ea. PRICE 1,250.00 1,500.00
4, Video Well TOTAL 7,500.00 9,000.00 NO BID
UNIT
2 ea. PRICE 43,400.00 84,000.00
5. Chemical Treatment TOTAL 86,800.00 168,000.00 NO BID
UNIT
2 ea. PRICE 8,000.00 14,000.00
6. Bore-blasting or Air Burst Treatment TOTAL 16,000.00 28,000.00 NO BID
UNIT
20 hrs. PRICE 625.00 2,050.00
7. Well Redevelopment by Surge Block and Airlift TOTAL 12,500.00 41,000.00 NO BID
UNIT
2 ea. PRICE 17,000.00 33,500.00
8. Furnish, install pump for testing and removal TOTAL 34,000.00 67,000.00 NO BID
UNIT
80 hrs. PRICE 410.00 300.00
9. Well Redevelopment by Pumping TOTAL 32,800.00 24,000.00
UNIT
16 hrs. PRICE 410.00 300.00
10. Constant Rate - Rate Drawdown Test TOTAL 6,560.00 4,800.00 NO BID
UNIT
2 ea. PRICE 8,100.00 6,500.00
11. Disinfection TOTAL 16,200.00 13,000.00 NO BID
*
TOTAL BID TOTAL 329,660.00 417,500.00 NO BID
Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days
Delivery
1
*LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Alsay, Inc. Demandstar
Davenport Drilling & Pump Service SAWS Website

Layne Christensen Co.
Peerless Equipment
Premium Water Services




